
   The Fertile-Beltrami Area
Community Fund has
issued a 2018 call for grant
applications. 
   Deadline for submission
is Nov. 1.
   The Fertile-Beltrami Area
Community Fund seeks
project proposals that will
address one or more of the
following: Beautification of
our community, recreation
or tourism, contribution to
the Fertile-Beltrami quality
of place, housing, economic
development or
youth/senior educational
experiences and opportuni-
ties. 
   Special consideration will
be given to projects that
attract people to the com-
munity, impact a number of
people/residents, employ
area residents, support the
local economy, partner with
other organizations and
provide a grant match
through either cash or
donated goods/services (in-
kind).
   Anyone who has a project
they would like the commit-
tee to consider can visit
www.nwmf.org/fund/fer-
tile-beltrami-area-commu-
nity-fund. There is an online
application available that
can be emailed to
Kylie@GrowingYourBusine
ss.com. 
   Applications can also be

picked up at the City Office
and mailed to:
   Fertile-Beltrami 
   Community Fund
   P.O. Box 4
   Fertile, MN  56540
   Anyone who wants to the
Community Fund, you can
do so through the secure
website or by mailing a
check to the address above. 
   The Fertile-Beltrami Area
Community Fund is a non-
profit organization and a
component fund of the
Northwest Minnesota
Foundation. 
   The fund has invested
more than $50,000 in
grants over its seven-year
history. 
   At its core, the
Community Fund is an
organization created with
gifts from generous people
committed to local causes. 
   For donors, the Com -
munity Fund serves as a
philanthropic advisor. 
   For the community, the
Community Fund serves as
a grant maker and a civic
leader. Through the support
of its donors and fundhold-
ers, the Community Fund
has been able to address
some of the community’s
most pressing needs,
including community
improvement, hunger and
education. For more infor-
mation, visit nwmf.org. 
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